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A Resolution Establishing a Student Leadership Award for Elected Student-at-Large 
Members of the Titan Student Centers Governing Board 

Sponsors: Kayleigh Bates and Yanitza Berrios 
Co-Sponsor: Jared Hill 

WHEREAS, The Associated Students, Incorporated (ASI) is a 501 (c)(3) nonprofit organization 
that operates as an auxiliary organization of California State University, Fullerton; and 

WHEREAS, ASI is governed by the ASI Board of Directors, who set policy for the organization, 
approve all funding allocations to programs and services, and advocate on behalf of student 
interests on committees and boards; and 

WHEREAS, the ASI Executive Officers enforce the policies of the organization, implement the 
programs and services of the organization, and represent the organization on campus and 
statewide levels; and 

WHEREAS, the Titan Student Centers Governing Board establishes policies for the Titan 
Student Centers to ensure the Titan Student Union, Student Recreation Center, and the Irvine 
lounge and fitness center are a unifying source between students, faculty, and staff; and 

WHEREAS, the Titan Student Centers Governing Board is a sub-board of the ASI Board of 
Directors; and 

WHEREAS, in the Spring of 2016 a resolution establishing a student leadership award model 
for ASI Student Leaders modified future distribution of financial awards; and 

WHEREAS, that within the four levels of Student Leadership Awards, category four (4) is the 
Student-At-Large members: Titan Student Centers Governing Board and AICA and 

WHEREAS, said resolution stated that Student-At-Large positions will continue to not receive a 
financial award, which is reflected in the organization's current practice; and 

WHEREAS, in the Fall of 2016 the ASI Board of Directors approved the amendment of the Titan 
Student Centers Governing Board Bylaws to require the election of the nine (9) Student-at­
Large positions as part of the annual student government elections; and 

WHEREAS, all other elected positions within ASI receive a financial award for their time 
commitments to the organization and are expected to uphold the same fiduciary responsibilities; 
therefore let it be 

RESOLVED, that with the adoption of this resolution, the ASI Board of Directors shall establish 
a financial award for Student-at-Large members on the Titan Student Centers Governing Board; 
and let it be 
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RESOLVED, within category four (4) there will be two groups: group one (1) will be Titan 
Student Centers Governing Board Student-At-Large members and group two (2) will be AICA's 
Student-At-Large members; and let it be 

RESOLVED, within category four (4) group one (1) they will be compensated at 5% of average 
cost of attendance as determined by the CSUF Financial Aid Office; where group two (2) will 
continue to be not compensated; and let it be 

RESOLVED, that the changes will be implemented for the 2017-2018 fiscal year; and let it be 
finally · 

RESOLVED, that this resolution be distributed to the following campus departments, divisions, 
and/or entities for their support and consideration: Office of the Vice President for Student 
Affairs, Office of the Dean of Students, ASI Executive Offices, ASI Leader & Program 
Development, and ASI Financial Services. 

Kay igh Bates 
Chair, B ard of Directors 

Veronica K eiss 
Vice Chair, Board f Directors 


